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Sales of dairy milk decreased by roughly 15 percent over 
the five-year period between 2012 and 2017.1 Meanwhile, sales 
of non-dairy food products such as almond milk, yogurt, ice 
cream and plant-based meat alternatives continue to gain market 
share.2 As an example, in 2018 plant-based milk sales were 1.6 
billion dollars which is a nine percent increase over the prior 
year.3 During that same time period, sales of cow’s milk were 
down 6 percent.4 The focus of this paper is a discussion of the 
war the dairy industry is waging against non-dairy alternatives.  
However, it is important to note that there are other, more 
substantial factors affecting dairy sales.   

 
I. REASONS FOR DECREASE IN DAIRY SALES 

 
The decrease in dairy sales is due to many factors.  These 

factors include an oversupply of milk which leads to falling milk 
prices.5  For example, milk prices have declined from $26 per 
hundred pounds to less than $17 per pound over the last five 
years.6  Another factor impacting dairy sales is the almost 30 
percent decline in milk consumption since the 1970s.7 Statistics 
show that each successive generation consumes less milk.8  
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Erratic trade policies such as retaliatory tariffs and lack of 
passage of a new North American trade deal have also 
contributed to the decline in dairy sales.    

 
When President Trump introduced tariffs on foreign steel 

imports in order to help the U.S. manufacturing sector, other 
countries, including Mexico, Canada, Europe and China 
implemented retaliatory tariffs on American goods.9 Tariffs 
imposed by Mexico and China included tariffs on certain dairy 
products.10 Mexico imposed a 25 percent tariff on dairy 
products11,12 and China imposed tariffs on milk and cream 
ranging from 35 to 40 percent.13 In general, retaliatory tariffs 
increase the cost of importing the products which leads to less 
demand by the foreign consumer.  In turn, income for the dairy 
farmer can be negatively impacted.14   

 
In the past, international markets accounted for 

approximately 20 percent of the dairy industry’s market.15 But 
trade wars have harmed many of these business relationships.  
Trade wars have also pushed the dairy industry into a longer than 
normal downward business cycle.  Historically, that cycle lasts 
for three years, but trade wars have expanded that cycle to five 
straight years.16   

 
Immigration policies have also made it difficult for 

farmers, including dairy farmers, to get reliable workers.17  
Changes in state and federal funding subsidies for dairy farmers 
have also affected revenues.18 Finally, as mentioned earlier, 
competition from non-dairy alternatives to cow’s milk also plays 
a small role in the decrease in revenue for dairy farms.  Non-
dairy alternatives account for about 1.8 billion dollars of the total 
milk market while cow’s milk represents about 12 billion dollars 
of that market.19 

 
 



II. BATTLES OVER NON-DAIRY ALTERNATIVES TO 
COW’S MILK 

 
  A non-exclusive list of non-dairy alternatives to cow’s 

milk include almond, coconut, soy, pea, oat and hemp milks.20  
The dairy industry has argued that these plant-based alternatives 
should not be called “milk.”21 A National Milk Federation 
spokesperson stated “you don’t got milk if it comes from a nut 
or a seed or a grain or a weed.”22 Some also argue that labeling 
these products as “milk” misleads consumers into thinking that 
the plant-based alternatives are nutritionally similar to dairy 
products.23 

 
In Gitson v. Trader Joe’s Co.,24 plaintiffs purchased 

several products at Trader Joe’s grocery including nonfat and 
low-fat yogurts as well as organic soymilk and organic chocolate 
soymilk.   Plaintiffs alleged that several Trader Joe’s products, 
including its soymilk product, were either misbranded or 
contained misleading labels. Specifically concerning the 
soymilk, the plaintiffs argued that they were misled because 
Trader Joe’s labeled its “soy beverage” as “milk.” However, 
plaintiffs contend that the soy beverage didn’t meet the 
definition of milk contained in the Food, Drug and Cosmetic 
Act.25 As such, plaintiffs argued that the Company’s labeling 
violated the California Unfair Competition Law.26 

 
The Court in Gitson looked to the Food, Drug and 

Cosmetic Act to determine whether the term “soymilk” could be 
considered false or misleading.27 The U.S. Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA) issued guidance in 2002 on the types of 
health claims that can be made on food labels.28 Since December 
2002, the FDA has followed the FTC's "reasonable consumer 
standard" in determining whether a food labeling claim is 
misleading.29  The reasonable consumer uses common sense and 
judgement.30 According to the Gitson court, a reasonable 
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consumer (as well as a least sophisticated consumer31) doesn’t 
think soymilk comes from a cow.  As a result, the court held that 
calling the product “soymilk” was not misleading. 

 
Next, plaintiffs argued that the word “soymilk” was 

misleading because by including the word “milk” in the title it 
implies that the product has a similar nutritional makeup as dairy 
milk.  The court dismissed this argument stating a reasonable 
consumer would not assume the products had the same 
nutritional values. Moreover, “if the consumer cared about the 
nutritional content, she would consult the label.”32 

 
A few years before Gitson a U.S. District Court heard a 

similar case.  In Ang. v. Whitewave Foods Co.,33 plaintiffs 
argued that the manufacturers of Silk© brand soy and almond 
milks violated the standard of identity for milk. In other words, 
the products do not meet the FDA’s definition for milk which 
states that milk “comes from the lacteal secretions of healthy 
cows.”34 But the court stated that the names accurately conveyed 
“the content of the beverages, while clearly distinguishing them 
from milk that is derived from dairy cows.”35 The court also 
determined that as a matter of law, plaintiffs’ claims were 
implausible because a reasonable consumer would not see the 
word “soymilk” or “almond milk” and disregard the first part of 
the word and assume the products were dairy milk that came 
from cows.36    

 
More recently, the Ninth Circuit similarly found that 

“almond milk” was not mislabeled simply because it has the 
term “milk” in its title.37 Plaintiffs in Painter v. Blue Diamond 
Growers38argued that because almond milk is “nutritionally 
inferior” to dairy milk it should be labeled “imitation milk.”  The 
court states that in order to require the term “imitation,” the 
product would have to involve substituting inferior ingredients 
for the ingredients in dairy milk.  Almond milk, the court notes, 



is not a “substitute” for dairy milk.  Instead, according to the 
court, it’s a separate and distinct food. The court gave a 
comparison to a case involving jam in order to illustrate the 
distinction.39  In 62 Cases of Jam v. U.S.,40 a product substituted 
the fruit in fruit jam with pectin.  The pectin or gelatin solution 
made the product an imitation of jam. Similarly, imitation 
vanilla can be used as a less expensive alternative for vanilla 
extract.  The Blue Diamond court went on to address Painter’s 
claim that almond milk is nutritionally inferior. The court 
concluded that a reasonable consumer would not be misled and 
would not assume that two distinct products have the same 
nutritional content.41 Like the court stated in Gitson, the 
consumer can simply read the label.42 

 
There have been hundreds of class action lawsuits filed 

against food and beverage manufacturers and Cary Silverman 
discusses them in an article about the reasonable consumer.43 
For example, Silverman asks whether workers on their lunch 
break are duped into believe that Subway’s “Footlong” 
sandwiches are precisely twelve inches long.  Or, “do consumers 
buy glazed ’raspberry filled’ or ‘blueberry cake’ donuts for the 
cancer-fighting benefits of real fruit?”44 

 
Some writers suggest that if non-dairy product names are 

misleading, then many other products would have to change 
their name too.  For example, milk of magnesia, cocoa butter, 
cream of wheat and peanut butter would all need to change their 
names.45 Although one distinction is that milk of magnesia and 
cocoa are not generally found in the dairy aisle while non-dairy 
and dairy milks and butters are usually found near each other in 
the dairy aisle, most people understand the distinction between 
milk from a cow and other non-dairy alternatives.  As a matter 
of fact, the common definition of “milk” includes more than the 
product produced by lactating cows. According to the 
Cambridge Dictionary, milk is (1) the white liquid produced by 



2020 / Almonds and Confusion / 67 
 

cows, goats and sheep…  Milk is also defined as (2) the white 
liquid produced by women and other female mammals as food 
for their young and finally, the definition includes (3) the white 
liquid produced by some plants and trees such as coconut milk 
(emphasis supplied).46 
 

III. THE HEALTH-CONSCIOUS MOVEMENT 
TOWARDS MORE WHOLE, PLANT- BASED 
FOODS 

 
In her law review comment, Incentivizing Transparency:  

Agricultural Benefit Corporations to Improve Consumer Trust, 
Kathryn Smith notes that denying non-dairy products the label 
“milk” would only serve to confuse customers at this point.  
Many health-conscious consumers of non-dairy products 
specifically choose to purchase almond or soy or oat or coconut 
milk and are well-aware of what they are purchasing.47 The 
author notes that the concern should be focused on issues such 
as hormone and non-hormone treated milk.  This is an area 
where the milk products do not have the same nutritional 
content, yet the different products are not clearly labeled as 
such.48 

In another law review article about the neuroscience of 
nutrition, the author talks about the relationship between food, 
health and the impact diet can have on cognitive decline for 
lawyers.  Diets such as the Mediterranean, and whole foods 
plant-based diets help to prevent depression and Alzheimer’s 
disease.49 The article discusses research involving whole foods, 
plant-based diets and points out that lawyers who follow a diet 
rich in plant-based whole foods lower the risk of cognitive 
decline while diets higher in processed foods increase the risk of 
cognitive decline.50 It is such health and nutrition research that 
has led to an increase in the number of consumers making 
healthier food choices.  People are seeking out information and 
choosing to replace meat and dairy with vegetables, fruits beans 



and whole grains.51 It is for these perceived health benefits that 
many consumers choose to purchase plant-based dairy 
alternatives such as almond or soymilk.52  

 
IV. LONG STANDING GOVERNMENT SUPPORT OF 

THE DAIRY INDUSTRY 
 
Despite the research findings supporting whole foods, 

plant-based diets, state and federal governments strongly and 
continuously support the powerful dairy industry.53 At the 
federal level, examples of government protection for the dairy 
industry include promoting milk through federal nutrition 
assistance programs such as food stamps and school lunch 
programs.    For example, federal assistance in providing milk to 
school children began in June 1940 with a federally subsidized 
program in low income Chicago neighborhoods.54  The program 
expanded to several other cities.  The way the program operated 
was dairies submitted bids to the U.S. Department of Agriculture 
(USDA).  Schools collected one cent per half pint and paid it 
directly to the dairies.  The difference between the one cent paid 
to the dairy farmer by the school and the cost of the milk was 
paid to the dairies by the USDA on a monthly basis.55 
Eventually, in 1946, the milk for the school children program 
became part of the National School Lunch Program.56 After 
several years, milk consumption began to wane.  To encourage 
the consumption of milk among school children, the 83rd 
Congress authorized the government to reimburse schools for 
milk served over and above the usual amount consumed.  
Reimbursement was at the rate of 4 cents per half pint over and 
above what was normally consumed.57 Eligibility was 
broadened to include child care centers, nursery schools, 
summer camps and other nonprofits that provided care for 
children.58 The program has required that milk be offered in 
order to receive federal reimbursement for meals.59 Federally 
subsidized school meals account for 7.6 percent of total fluid 
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milk sales.60 On the other hand, at least one study found that 
“people who drank three glasses of milk a day had a higher risk 
of dying over 20 years than those who drank one glass per 
day.”61 There is a growing recognition among doctors that high 
dairy intake can increase risks of heart disease, cancer, and 
weight gain according to a recent Bloomberg Businessweek 
article.62 The requirement mandating milk as part of the school 
lunch program exists despite the fact the majority of Native, 
Asian and African Americans are lactose intolerant63 and despite 
the growing evidence that dairy may not be as healthy as 
traditionally thought.64 

 
Research findings suggest benefits to eating whole food, 

plant-based diets that do not use animal products, but the dairy 
industry65as well as some state and federal legislators, continue 
to challenge plant-based foods.66 Tammy Baldwin, Senator from 
the dairy-rich state of Wisconsin, introduced the “Defending 
Against Imitation Replacements of Yogurt, Milk and Cheese to 
Promote Regular Intake of Dairy Everyday Act” (The Dairy 
Pride Act) in 2017 and reintroduced the bill on March 14, 
2019.67 The Bill would require that the FDA enforce the legal 
definition of milk and prohibit plant-based alternatives from 
using terms such as milk, cheese and yogurt.68 
 

A similar measure was introduced as a legislative 
resolution in Nebraska.69 The resolution urges the U.S. 
Government to establish and enforce labeling rules for plant-
based “imitation milk” that is truthful, not misleading and that 
differentiates between dairy products and non-dairy beverages. 

 
On March 21, 2017 Michael Dykes, the CEO of the 

International Dairy Foods Association (IDFA), testified before 
the House Agriculture Committee about  the Dairy Pride Act.   
During his testimony, Dykes indicated that he no longer 
supported the bill.  He  stated that the labeling issue “is probably 

about:blank
about:blank


an issue that needs to be resolved in the marketplace,” and also 
stated that “the FDA has not concluded these [labels] are 
misleading and there have been court challenges and the courts 
have not concluded that they have been misleading.”70 

 
V. NUTRITION LABELS, HORMONES, AND FREE 

SPEECH  
 

When it comes to discussing health benefits of foods, the 
FDAs labeling laws seem outdated and are nonresponsive to 
consumer demand.71 Hormone treated cow’s milk is a good 
example.  If a consumer wants to know whether the milk she is 
drinking contains hormones, FDA regulations make it difficult 
to find out the truth.72  The FDA’s Guidance states that there is 
“no significant difference between milk from treated and 
untreated cows.” The Agency therefore asserts that is does not 
have authority to require special labeling for hormone-treated 
milk.73  In addition, the Agency also believes that since there is 
some naturally occurring bST (hormones) in cow’s milk, 
labeling even untreated milk as hormone free would be 
untruthful.74 The state of Vermont passed a law requiring 
hormone containing milk to state so on the label.75 However, the 
dairy industry challenged the requirement on compelled speech 
grounds, arguing that the statute infringed on their right not to 
speak. The Second Circuit agreed with the challengers and the 
Vermont statute was ruled unconstitutional.76 

 
Instead of the dairy industry raising free speech issues, 

some writers have suggested that plant-based alternative 
producers may raise free speech challenges if they are required 
to stop using the term milk or are required to use words such as 
“imitation.”77 In comments submitted to the FDA, the Institute 
for Justice stated that a  labeling ban “would confuse consumers, 
harm small businesses across the country, and raise serious First 
Amendment concerns.”78 In support of its First Amendment 
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argument, the Institute referenced the Ocheesee Creamery v. 
Putnam case. 

 
In Ocheesee, plaintiff is a small dairy creamery located in 

Florida.  It sells all-natural dairy products including cream and 
skim milk.  The cream is made according to industry standard 
by skimming the cream off the top of the milk. The leftover 
product is sold as skim milk. One of the side effects of the 
skimming process is that it removes almost all the vitamin A 
naturally present in whole milk. This is because vitamin A is fat-
soluble, so it is removed along with the cream. Because the 
Creamery prides itself on selling only all-natural products 
without additives, it refused to replace the vitamin A.  Its product 
contains no ingredients other than skim milk. Florida law 
prohibits the sale of skim milk that does not replace the vitamin 
A lost during skimming. Because the creamery sells all-natural 
products, it refused.  The state of Florida told Creamery that it 
could either put the vitamin A in or label its product “imitation 
skim milk,” or “milk product.” 

 
The court applied the four-point test of Cent. Hudson Gas 

& Elec. Corp. v. Pub. Serv. Comm’n,79 to determine if the state’s 
regulation of Creamery’s commercial advertising was proper.  
Here, the court found that Creamery’s use of the word “skim 
milk” to describe its milk was not inherently misleading. In 
applying the remaining prongs of Central Hudson, the court 
found that the State had a substantial interest in establishing 
nutritional standards for milk. It also assumed that the restriction 
directly advanced the states interest.  However, the court ruled 
that the regulation was more extensive than necessary and there 
were less restrictive ways of regulating the product. For 
example, the state could have allowed use of the term skim milk 
with a disclaimer stating that the product lacked vitamin A. 

 



Similar to the Ocheesee case, the FDA in the case of 
plant-based milk products can permit consumers to compare the 
nutrient labels to ascertain the nutrition of the dairy versus non-
dairy products. Moreover, use of the term “milk” would likely 
not cause confusion as buyers understand that almond milk is 
made from almonds and not from a lactating cow. As the court 
in Ang noted, under [that] logic, a reasonable consumer might 
also believe that veggie bacon contains pork, that flourless 
chocolate cake contains flour, or that e-books are made out of 
paper.80 
 
VI. COMPETITION AND MARGARINE WARS  
 

The dairy industry’s challenge against competitors is 
nothing new. As far back as 1886, margarine manufacturers 
faced similar challenges from the dairy industry through passage 
of the Oleomargarine Act of 1886.81 Under the so-called 
“margarine wars” campaigns at both the state and federal levels 
fought to either outright prevent butter substitutes or to regulate 
the substitutes, sometimes to the point of extinction. 

 
People v Marx,82challenged New York state’s outright 

ban on the sale of margarine. The law carried a very high 
penalty, especially for 1885. In New York State, selling 
margarine carried a penalty of one year in jail, a $ 1,000 fine, or 
both for each offense.  However, the court held that the law was 
unconstitutional because the law was really prohibiting the sale 
of any butter substitute.  The law’s aim was to protect the dairy 
industry rather than protect consumers from fraud or deceit.83  

 
In Powell v. Pennsylvania,84 the state legislature passed a 

law banning the manufacture or sale of any product designed to 
take the place of butter or cheese unless the product was made 
from milk or cream.  In contrast to the earlier New York case, 
Pennsylvania used its police powers to determine that the sale or 
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intent to sell margarine is fraudulent because it is designed to 
take the place of butter.  Moreover, the state determined that 
margarine is harmful to the health of its citizens.   Because it was 
within the state’s police powers to protect its citizens, the U.S. 
Supreme Court upheld the conviction.85 By 1897, the U.S. 
Congress had recognized margarine as a healthy and nutritious 
product that could be an item of interstate commerce.86 As a 
result, the court in Schollenberger v. Pennsylvania87 held that 
the state could not use its police powers to prevent a dealer from 
bringing his margarine into Pennsylvania through interstate 
travels and selling it in Pennsylvania.88 

 
 In lieu of outright bans on the sale of margarine, there 
were drives at both the state and federal levels to regulate the 
color of margarine, such as prohibiting it from being yellow or 
mandating that it be colored pink.89  Of course, most consumers 
wouldn’t want to buy pink margarine, so the law would in reality 
severely diminish the company’s business.90 At the federal level, 
a prohibitive tax was imposed on yellow (or colored) 
margarine.91  The law basically required that margarine “sold in 
interstate commerce” remain “natural” (white) in color.92  
Margarine manufacturers such as Fleishman’s began adding a 
package of special fats that when squeezed by the consumer 
would give the margarine a yellow tinge.93 Simultaneously, the 
dairy industry continued its assault on margarine manufacturers 
including publishing false and horrifying rumors about how 
margarine was produced.94 It was not until the 1950’s that war-
on-margarine type laws were abolished and free and open 
competition was permitted.95 Today, butter has a larger market 
share than margarine and more consumers prefer creamy butter 
to the margarine counterpart.96   
 
 
 

 



VII. ALTERNATIVES FOR DAIRY FARMERS 
 
Financial assistance should be available to help 

America’s dairy farmers pursue alternatives including growing 
different crops including whole foods used in making dairy 
alternatives.97   For example, in Finland the government assisted 
dairy farmers by helping them switch to berry farming.98 As the 
world faces environmental and sustainability issues, 
governments should assist farmers in creating alternatives.  
Methane gas digesters that allow dairy farmers to capture 
methane gas and use it to generate electricity is one example that 
helps the environment and produces an alternate source of 
revenue for our farmers.99 
 
VIII. CONCLUSION 
 

Dairy market revenues are declining, in part due to 
consumers turning to plant-based alternatives.  Waging war over 
the use of the word “milk” by manufacturers of non-dairy 
alternatives is misplaced.   Courts have repeatedly held that the 
reasonable consumer is not misled by the term almond or 
soymilk.  Consumers do not believe the non-dairy alternative 
comes from a cow.  Similarly, courts have found that the 
argument about the differing nutritional values does not cause 
consumer confusion.  Consumers interested in the nutritional 
content will read the nutrition label.  It seems that more focus 
should be spent on the deeper issues affecting dairy farmers 
including lack of trade agreements, lack of subsidies and lack of 
assistance in helping dairy farmers pursue alternatives including 
growing different crops including whole foods used in making 
dairy alternatives.    
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